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JOB OPPORTUNITY 

 
  

UTILITY REGULATORY AUDITOR I/II/III 
 
The Missouri Public Service Commission Tariff/Rate Design Department is seeking an 
Auditor in our Jefferson City office.  Duties include performing audits and examinations 
related to tariff issues that affect Missouri’s investor owned electric, steam, and natural 
gas utilities and their customers. 
 
This is a responsible, professional position that will review requests that will have 
impacts in utility ratemaking.  The position also requires extremely detailed verification 
of analyses presented by regulated utilities, consultants, and other interested parties.  
The auditor in this position will develop and make recommendations, including written 
and oral testimony, to the Commission based on the results of his/her analysis of the 
issues. 
 
QUALIFICATIONS:  Graduation from an accredited four-year college or university with 
specialization in accounting, finance, economics, business or public administration or 
closely related area, including or supplemented by twenty-four semester hours of 
accounting or finance coursework required.  December graduates are welcome to 
apply. Starting salary will be commensurate with education and experience.  Must be 
familiar with generally accepted accounting principles and audit standards.  Good 
communication, interpersonal skills, and writing skills are essential.  Computer 
experience required with a working knowledge of Microsoft Word, Excel, PowerPoint, 
and Access software applications preferred.  The ability to work well in a team 
environment is a must. 
 
Annual salary for Utility Regulatory Auditor I is $39,708; Utility Regulatory Auditor II is 
$42,000; and Utility Regulatory Auditor III is $48,852.  To be considered for this position, 
submit an application, resume, and a copy of each transcript from all 
colleges/universities attended by 5:00 pm November 30, 2018 to: MO Public Service 
Commission, Reference # CS181118, P.O. Box 360, Jefferson City, MO  65102 via e-
mail to pscjobs@psc.mo.gov.  For additional information, visit 
http://psc.mo.gov/General/Career_Opportunities.    
 
 “An Equal Opportunity Employer M/F/D/V” 
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